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The Christian Apocrypha burst into the public consciousness in 2003, following the publication of The Da
Vinci Code by Dan Brown. Interest in the wide assortment of texts not included in the Bible has remained
strong ever since. Although much has been written and said on the subject, misunderstandings still abound.

Tony Burke's Secret Scriptures Revealed dismantles the many myths and misconceptions about the Christian
Apocrypha and straightforwardly answers common questions like these:

Where did the apocryphal texts come from and who wrote them?●

Why were they not included in the Bible?●

Is reading these texts harmful to personal faith?●

The book describes and explains numerous fascinating apocryphal stories, including many that are not well
known. Instead of dismissing or smearing the Christian Apocrypha, Burke shows how these texts can help us
better understand early Christian communities and the canonical Bible.
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From reader reviews:

Don Gonzales:

Now a day individuals who Living in the era wherever everything reachable by connect with the internet and
the resources within it can be true or not call for people to be aware of each info they get. How many people
to be smart in having any information nowadays? Of course the answer is reading a book. Reading through a
book can help persons out of this uncertainty Information especially this Secret Scriptures Revealed: A New
Introduction to the Christian Apocrypha book as this book offers you rich facts and knowledge. Of course
the details in this book hundred pct guarantees there is no doubt in it you know.

Lisa Langlais:

Are you kind of active person, only have 10 or maybe 15 minute in your day time to upgrading your mind
ability or thinking skill perhaps analytical thinking? Then you are experiencing problem with the book than
can satisfy your short time to read it because all this time you only find guide that need more time to be
examine. Secret Scriptures Revealed: A New Introduction to the Christian Apocrypha can be your answer
given it can be read by you who have those short extra time problems.

Thomas Rojas:

Many people spending their time frame by playing outside having friends, fun activity along with family or
just watching TV the entire day. You can have new activity to shell out your whole day by looking at a book.
Ugh, do you consider reading a book can actually hard because you have to accept the book everywhere? It
fine you can have the e-book, taking everywhere you want in your Smart phone. Like Secret Scriptures
Revealed: A New Introduction to the Christian Apocrypha which is finding the e-book version. So , try out
this book? Let's notice.

John Johnson:

You will get this Secret Scriptures Revealed: A New Introduction to the Christian Apocrypha by look at the
bookstore or Mall. Just simply viewing or reviewing it can to be your solve challenge if you get difficulties
for the knowledge. Kinds of this reserve are various. Not only by simply written or printed but in addition
can you enjoy this book by e-book. In the modern era just like now, you just looking because of your mobile
phone and searching what your problem. Right now, choose your ways to get more information about your
guide. It is most important to arrange yourself to make your knowledge are still upgrade. Let's try to choose
appropriate ways for you.
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