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An interdisciplinary collection, Gender and Culture at the Limit of Rights examines the potential and
limitations of the "women's rights as human rights" framework as a strategy for seeking gender justice.
Drawing on detailed case studies from the United States, Africa, Latin America, Asia, and elsewhere,
contributors to the volume explore the specific social histories, political struggles, cultural assumptions, and
gender ideologies that have produced certain rights or reframed long-standing debates in the language of
rights.

The essays address the gender-specific ways in which rights-based protocols have been analyzed, deployed,
and legislated in the past and the present and the implications for women and men, adults and children in
various social and geographical locations. Questions addressed include: What are the gendered assumptions
and effects of the dominance of rights-based discourses for claims to social justice? What kinds of
opportunities and limitations does such a "culture of rights" provide to seekers of justice, whether individuals
or collectives, and how are these gendered? How and why do female bodies often become the site of
contention in contexts pitting cultural against juridical perspectives?

The contributors speak to central issues in current scholarly and policy debates about gender, culture, and
human rights from comparative disciplinary, historical, and geographical perspectives. By taking "gender,"
rather than just "women," seriously as a category of analysis, the chapters suggest that the very sources of the
power of human rights discourses, specifically "women's rights as human rights" discourses, to produce
social change are also the sources of its limitations.
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From reader reviews:

Lorraine Briggs:

Inside other case, little people like to read book Gender and Culture at the Limit of Rights (Pennsylvania
Studies in Human Rights). You can choose the best book if you like reading a book. As long as we know
about how is important any book Gender and Culture at the Limit of Rights (Pennsylvania Studies in Human
Rights). You can add knowledge and of course you can around the world by the book. Absolutely right,
because from book you can understand everything! From your country until eventually foreign or abroad you
will find yourself known. About simple matter until wonderful thing you could know that. In this era, we can
easily open a book or even searching by internet device. It is called e-book. You need to use it when you feel
weary to go to the library. Let's go through.

Jeremy Clayton:

Gender and Culture at the Limit of Rights (Pennsylvania Studies in Human Rights) can be one of your starter
books that are good idea. We recommend that straight away because this publication has good vocabulary
that may increase your knowledge in vocab, easy to understand, bit entertaining but still delivering the
information. The article author giving his/her effort to get every word into joy arrangement in writing Gender
and Culture at the Limit of Rights (Pennsylvania Studies in Human Rights) but doesn't forget the main level,
giving the reader the hottest in addition to based confirm resource data that maybe you can be certainly one
of it. This great information could drawn you into completely new stage of crucial imagining.

Roy Stoudt:

Can you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt if you find yourself in the book store? Aim
to pick one book that you never know the inside because don't determine book by its cover may doesn't work
this is difficult job because you are scared that the inside maybe not while fantastic as in the outside look
likes. Maybe you answer might be Gender and Culture at the Limit of Rights (Pennsylvania Studies in
Human Rights) why because the wonderful cover that make you consider concerning the content will not
disappoint an individual. The inside or content is fantastic as the outside or perhaps cover. Your reading 6th
sense will directly direct you to pick up this book.

James Stevens:

Beside this kind of Gender and Culture at the Limit of Rights (Pennsylvania Studies in Human Rights) in
your phone, it could possibly give you a way to get more close to the new knowledge or data. The
information and the knowledge you are going to got here is fresh from oven so don't end up being worry if
you feel like an older people live in narrow small town. It is good thing to have Gender and Culture at the
Limit of Rights (Pennsylvania Studies in Human Rights) because this book offers for you readable
information. Do you sometimes have book but you rarely get what it's interesting features of. Oh come on,
that won't happen if you have this within your hand. The Enjoyable agreement here cannot be questionable,



like treasuring beautiful island. Use you still want to miss the item? Find this book along with read it from
currently!
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