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This book brings together the best advice for cultivating fruit trees, berries, and shrubs, using biodynamic
methods with the aim of harvesting healthy fruit free of pesticides.

Ehrenfried Pfeiffer, a pioneer of biodynamics in North America, discusses the principles of tree biology
before describing the measures that can be taken to develop a pest-free orchard without the use of chemicals.
He discusses soil preparation, the selection of trees for planting, issues of transplanting and pruning, the
application of pastes, green cover crops, and pest control, before describing the key biodynamic preparations
and how to spray them with greatest effectiveness.

Michael Maltas ran fruit tree experiments on his biodynamic farm in Missouri for four years. The results are
recorded in a highly practical annual spraying schedule for orchards, which is reproduced in this book. A
month-by-month calendar gives information on specific methods and controls, based on Maltas’s extensive
experience.

This is an invaluable book with practical advice on all aspects of planning and maintaining a healthy orchard.

This volume combines a thoroughly revised and updated edition of Biodynamic Treatment of Fruit Trees,
Berries and Shrubs by Ehrenfried Pfeiffer and Orchard Pest Management and Spray Schedule by Michael
Maltas. Published in association with the Biodynamic Farming and Gardening Association.
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From reader reviews:

Lillian Chatman:

Have you spare time for any day? What do you do when you have considerably more or little spare time?
Yes, you can choose the suitable activity with regard to spend your time. Any person spent all their spare
time to take a go walking, shopping, or went to the particular Mall. How about open as well as read a book
eligible The Biodynamic Orchard Book? Maybe it is for being best activity for you. You recognize beside
you can spend your time with your favorite's book, you can cleverer than before. Do you agree with it is
opinion or you have various other opinion?

Megan Fairbanks:

People live in this new day of lifestyle always try to and must have the free time or they will get lot of stress
from both daily life and work. So , once we ask do people have time, we will say absolutely yes. People is
human not just a robot. Then we request again, what kind of activity are you experiencing when the spare
time coming to a person of course your answer will certainly unlimited right. Then do you ever try this one,
reading books. It can be your alternative inside spending your spare time, typically the book you have read is
usually The Biodynamic Orchard Book.

Sarah Frigo:

Reading a book being new life style in this season; every people loves to examine a book. When you study a
book you can get a lot of benefit. When you read textbooks, you can improve your knowledge, due to the
fact book has a lot of information into it. The information that you will get depend on what forms of book
that you have read. If you wish to get information about your research, you can read education books, but if
you want to entertain yourself you are able to a fiction books, these kinds of us novel, comics, in addition to
soon. The The Biodynamic Orchard Book provide you with a new experience in looking at a book.

Ana Jimenez:

Beside this specific The Biodynamic Orchard Book in your phone, it could possibly give you a way to get
closer to the new knowledge or facts. The information and the knowledge you might got here is fresh from
your oven so don't be worry if you feel like an aged people live in narrow small town. It is good thing to
have The Biodynamic Orchard Book because this book offers for you readable information. Do you
oftentimes have book but you would not get what it's exactly about. Oh come on, that would not happen if
you have this in the hand. The Enjoyable blend here cannot be questionable, similar to treasuring beautiful
island. So do you still want to miss the idea? Find this book and read it from at this point!
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