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Scores of books and articles have been published, addressing one or another aspect of the Islamic Revolution
in Iran. Missing from this body of scholarship, however, has been a comprehensive analysis of the
intellectual and ideological cornerstones of one of the most dramatic revolutions in our time. In this
remarkable volume, Hamid Dabashi brings together, in a sustained and engagingly written narrative, the
leading revolutionaries who have shaped the ideological disposition of this cataclysmic event. Dabashi has
spent over ten years studying the writings, in their original Persian and Arabic, of the most influential Iranian
clerics and thinkers.

Examining the revolutionary sentiments and ideas of such figures as Jalal Al-e Ahmad, Ali Sharicati,
Morteza Motahhari, Sayyad Abolhasan Bani-Sadr, and finally the Ayatollah Khomeini, the work also
analyzes the larger historical and theoretical implications of any construction of "the Islamic Ideology."
Carefully located in the social and intellectual context of the four decades preceding the 1979 revolution,
Theology of Discontent is the definitive treatment of the ideological foundations of the Islamic Revolution,
with particular attention to the larger, more enduring ramifications of this revolution for radical Islamic
revivalism in the entire Muslim world.

This volume will be of interest to Islamicists, Middle East historians and specialists, as well as scholars and
students of "liberation theologies," comparative religious revolutions, and mass collective behavior. Bruce
Lawrence of Duke University calls this volume "a superb and unprecedented study.... In brilliant figural
strokes, he arrays EuroAmerican sociological theory as the crucial backdrop of a deeper understanding of
contemporary Iranian history."
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From reader reviews:

Christopher Price:

Nowadays reading books become more than want or need but also become a life style. This reading
addiction give you lot of advantages. The huge benefits you got of course the knowledge the actual
information inside the book in which improve your knowledge and information. The information you get
based on what kind of e-book you read, if you want attract knowledge just go with education and learning
books but if you want sense happy read one together with theme for entertaining for example comic or novel.
The Theology of Discontent: The Ideological Foundation of the Islamic Revolution in Iran is kind of e-book
which is giving the reader unpredictable experience.

Gerardo Whittaker:

This Theology of Discontent: The Ideological Foundation of the Islamic Revolution in Iran is great guide for
you because the content that is full of information for you who always deal with world and have to make
decision every minute. This kind of book reveal it data accurately using great arrange word or we can declare
no rambling sentences included. So if you are read it hurriedly you can have whole info in it. Doesn't mean it
only will give you straight forward sentences but difficult core information with lovely delivering sentences.
Having Theology of Discontent: The Ideological Foundation of the Islamic Revolution in Iran in your hand
like obtaining the world in your arm, details in it is not ridiculous a single. We can say that no e-book that
offer you world in ten or fifteen tiny right but this guide already do that. So , this can be good reading book.
Hello Mr. and Mrs. occupied do you still doubt that?

Verla Foster:

The book untitled Theology of Discontent: The Ideological Foundation of the Islamic Revolution in Iran
contain a lot of information on the idea. The writer explains the girl idea with easy technique. The language
is very simple to implement all the people, so do certainly not worry, you can easy to read it. The book was
published by famous author. The author brings you in the new time of literary works. You can easily read
this book because you can read more your smart phone, or product, so you can read the book within
anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy the e-book, you can start their official web-site along with order
it. Have a nice study.

Anna Thompson:

Do you like reading a e-book? Confuse to looking for your chosen book? Or your book has been rare? Why
so many question for the book? But virtually any people feel that they enjoy to get reading. Some people
likes examining, not only science book but also novel and Theology of Discontent: The Ideological
Foundation of the Islamic Revolution in Iran as well as others sources were given know-how for you. After
you know how the good a book, you feel wish to read more and more. Science publication was created for
teacher or maybe students especially. Those publications are helping them to add their knowledge. In some



other case, beside science publication, any other book likes Theology of Discontent: The Ideological
Foundation of the Islamic Revolution in Iran to make your spare time more colorful. Many types of book like
this.
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