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Hundreds of glorious photographs and an evocative text offer an insider's look at the exotic style of the
"island of the gods."
Since early this century, Bali's paradisiacal beauty and the remarkable spirit of its people have attracted a
steady stream of artists, architects, anthropologists, mystics, and celebrities from all over the world, and the
new residents have interpreted traditional Balinese style with elegant, chic, eccentric, and inspiring results.
Featured in this exquisitely illustrated volume are 24 exceptional homes, both traditional and modern, all
shown in their lush tropical surroundings. They include the pondok pavilion dwellings of the rice fields,
classic village houses, royal palaces, beach houses, spectacular mountain residences, and homes with
magnificently designed gardens. The book also features the courtyard shrines and the public temples that
play a role in daily life for both the Balinese and the newer residents.
A visitor's guide and international source list of Balinese wares completes this insider's tour of the island,
making At Home in Bali the next best thing to being there.
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From reader reviews:

Christopher Price:

Do you have favorite book? Should you have, what is your favorite's book? Reserve is very important thing
for us to learn everything in the world. Each guide has different aim or even goal; it means that e-book has
different type. Some people really feel enjoy to spend their time to read a book. They are reading whatever
they consider because their hobby is reading a book. Consider the person who don't like reading a book?
Sometime, man or woman feel need book if they found difficult problem or perhaps exercise. Well, probably
you'll have this At Home in Bali.

Edwin Courville:

This At Home in Bali are usually reliable for you who want to certainly be a successful person, why. The
reason why of this At Home in Bali can be one of several great books you must have is actually giving you
more than just simple reading food but feed a person with information that possibly will shock your previous
knowledge. This book is usually handy, you can bring it everywhere and whenever your conditions in the e-
book and printed ones. Beside that this At Home in Bali giving you an enormous of experience for instance
rich vocabulary, giving you tryout of critical thinking that we realize it useful in your day pastime. So , let's
have it and luxuriate in reading.

Donald Lombard:

Publication is one of source of expertise. We can add our information from it. Not only for students but
additionally native or citizen have to have book to know the change information of year in order to year. As
we know those textbooks have many advantages. Beside many of us add our knowledge, may also bring us
to around the world. With the book At Home in Bali we can take more advantage. Don't you to definitely be
creative people? To become creative person must want to read a book. Simply choose the best book that
suitable with your aim. Don't end up being doubt to change your life with that book At Home in Bali. You
can more desirable than now.

Yolanda Harris:

Some people said that they feel bored stiff when they reading a publication. They are directly felt the item
when they get a half regions of the book. You can choose the book At Home in Bali to make your own
reading is interesting. Your skill of reading proficiency is developing when you similar to reading. Try to
choose straightforward book to make you enjoy to learn it and mingle the sensation about book and looking
at especially. It is to be very first opinion for you to like to open up a book and go through it. Beside that the
book At Home in Bali can to be your friend when you're sense alone and confuse with what must you're
doing of that time.
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