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K2 blackpearl and the K2 platform is a large, powerful, "game-changing" application platform built on
Microsoft technologies. Understanding it from top to bottom would be a great task for a single person, which
is why we have gathered more than a dozen authors to supply you with the information to successfully
transform your company into a process-oriented, efficient business that can grow with the K2 platform.

Since this is the first book on K2 blackpearl, you will find a broad range of topics in this book, from the
market in which K2 blackpearl is aimed to the architecture of the platform, from how to approach process
design to developing your own custom user manager.

The first part of the book is meant for everyone and provides an understanding of K2 blackpearl and where it
fits in the marketplace. It is included to provide a framework for thinking about various aspects of process-
driven applications, including how they differ from business process management techniques; identifying
processes in your company to automate, the different pieces that make up a process; measuring the success
of your efforts; and finally shifting your company's culture in the direction of process efficiency. This section
may be the only section you need to read if you are sponsoring a process improvement effort in your
company. If you are responsible for leading the effort, make sure to read Chapters 3 and 4.

The other parts are meant to provide details on how to effectively deploy and use K2 blackpearl and include
a broad range of topics. Read what you are most interested in, but also make sure to read Chapter 8, which
will give you a great foundation to start designing processes with K2 blackpearl. Chapter 14 is also
recommended for everyone because it provides an overview of the available K2 Designers and how you can
share projects among them.

K2 blackpearl is the main subject of this book, although we devote an entire chapter, Chapter 23, to the add-
on product K2 connect to give you an understanding of how to bring SAP data into your processes. We also
talk a bit about K2 blackpoint, particularly in the SharePoint chapters. Since K2 blackpoint is built on the K2
blackpearl foundation, many of the same concepts apply to that product as well, but we do not point out the
differences between K2 blackpearl and K2 blackpoint. For that information browse to www.k2.com.
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From reader reviews:

Sun Byrd:

Do you have favorite book? Should you have, what is your favorite's book? E-book is very important thing
for us to find out everything in the world. Each guide has different aim as well as goal; it means that guide
has different type. Some people feel enjoy to spend their a chance to read a book. These are reading whatever
they acquire because their hobby is actually reading a book. What about the person who don't like looking at
a book? Sometime, man feel need book after they found difficult problem or exercise. Well, probably you'll
have this Professional K2 blackpearl.

Karen Bell:

Often the book Professional K2 blackpearl will bring one to the new experience of reading some sort of
book. The author style to elucidate the idea is very unique. In case you try to find new book to study, this
book very suitable to you. The book Professional K2 blackpearl is much recommended to you to learn. You
can also get the e-book from the official web site, so you can quickly to read the book.

Mohammad Darling:

Professional K2 blackpearl can be one of your basic books that are good idea. We recommend that straight
away because this e-book has good vocabulary that will increase your knowledge in language, easy to
understand, bit entertaining but nevertheless delivering the information. The copy writer giving his/her effort
that will put every word into joy arrangement in writing Professional K2 blackpearl yet doesn't forget the
main position, giving the reader the hottest as well as based confirm resource data that maybe you can be one
among it. This great information can drawn you into completely new stage of crucial considering.

Dorothy Cropper:

Reading a reserve make you to get more knowledge from this. You can take knowledge and information
originating from a book. Book is published or printed or created from each source which filled update of
news. In this particular modern era like at this point, many ways to get information are available for a person.
From media social like newspaper, magazines, science guide, encyclopedia, reference book, story and comic.
You can add your understanding by that book. Ready to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or
just trying to find the Professional K2 blackpearl when you needed it?
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