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Prudentius' Psychomachia, written about A.D. 405, has been studied by classicists, medievalists, and general
literary historians. Nevertheless, scholars have barely explored the allegory's inner workings or related it to
its historical context. The present study remedies this critical neglect and its attendant misreadings.

The author arrives at a coherent, unified interpretation by examining the work's major features in relation to
the poet's life and times. He contends that the poet balanced an affirmation of Christian allegory with an
ironic negation of pagan literary tradition. For this remarkable achievement his audience was the aristocracy,
still largely pagan at a time of intense antagonism between the Church and old Roman religious institutions.

Originally published in 1976.

The Princeton Legacy Library uses the latest print-on-demand technology to again make available
previously out-of-print books from the distinguished backlist of Princeton University Press. These editions
preserve the original texts of these important books while presenting them in durable paperback and
hardcover editions. The goal of the Princeton Legacy Library is to vastly increase access to the rich scholarly
heritage found in the thousands of books published by Princeton University Press since its founding in 1905.
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From reader reviews:

Grace Moreno:

Throughout other case, little folks like to read book Prudentius' "Psychomachia": A Reexamination
(Princeton Legacy Library). You can choose the best book if you want reading a book. Providing we know
about how is important any book Prudentius' "Psychomachia": A Reexamination (Princeton Legacy Library).
You can add know-how and of course you can around the world by the book. Absolutely right, because from
book you can realize everything! From your country until eventually foreign or abroad you will be known.
About simple thing until wonderful thing it is possible to know that. In this era, we can easily open a book or
maybe searching by internet product. It is called e-book. You can use it when you feel weary to go to the
library. Let's go through.

Douglas Stevens:

The reserve untitled Prudentius' "Psychomachia": A Reexamination (Princeton Legacy Library) is the
publication that recommended to you to study. You can see the quality of the reserve content that will be
shown to you actually. The language that publisher use to explained their way of doing something is easily to
understand. The copy writer was did a lot of analysis when write the book, to ensure the information that
they share to you personally is absolutely accurate. You also could get the e-book of Prudentius'
"Psychomachia": A Reexamination (Princeton Legacy Library) from the publisher to make you far more
enjoy free time.

Alta Favors:

The reserve with title Prudentius' "Psychomachia": A Reexamination (Princeton Legacy Library) has lot of
information that you can discover it. You can get a lot of profit after read this book. This specific book exist
new expertise the information that exist in this e-book represented the condition of the world currently. That
is important to yo7u to find out how the improvement of the world. This book will bring you throughout new
era of the internationalization. You can read the e-book on your smart phone, so you can read the item
anywhere you want.

Nelson McNamee:

Playing with family inside a park, coming to see the ocean world or hanging out with friends is thing that
usually you have done when you have spare time, in that case why you don't try thing that really opposite
from that. 1 activity that make you not feeling tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you are
ride on and with addition details. Even you love Prudentius' "Psychomachia": A Reexamination (Princeton
Legacy Library), it is possible to enjoy both. It is very good combination right, you still would like to miss
it? What kind of hang-out type is it? Oh seriously its mind hangout guys. What? Still don't buy it, oh come
on its named reading friends.
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