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Since the beginning of the modern era of algebraic topology, simplicial methods have been used
systematically and effectively for both computation and basic theory. With the development of Quillen's
concept of a closed model category and, in particular, a simplicial model category, this collection of methods
has become the primary way to describe non-abelian homological algebra and to address homotopy-
theoretical issues in a variety of fields, including algebraic K-theory. This book supplies a modern exposition
of these ideas, emphasizing model category theoretical techniques. Discussed here are the homotopy theory
of simplicial sets, and other basic topics such as simplicial groups, Postnikov towers, and bisimplicial sets.
The more advanced material includes homotopy limits and colimits, localization with respect to a map and
with respect to a homology theory, cosimplicial spaces, and homotopy coherence. Interspersed throughout
are many results and ideas well-known to experts, but uncollected in the literature. Intended for second-year
graduate students and beyond, this book introduces many of the basic tools of modern homotopy theory. An
extensive background in topology is not assumed. Reviews: '… a book filling an obvious gap in the literature
and the authors have done an excellent job on it. No monograph or expository paper has been published on
this topic in the last twenty-eight years.' - Analele Universitatii din Timisoara '… is clearly presented and a
brief summary preceding every chapter is useful to the reader. The book should prove enlightening to a
broad range of readers including prospective students and researchers who want to apply simplicial
techniques for whatever reason.' - Zentralblatt MATH '… they succeed. The book is an excellent account of
simplicial homotopy theory from a modern point of view […] The book is well written. […] The book can
be highly recommended to anybody who wants to learn and to apply simplicial techniques and/or the theory
of (simplicial) closed model categories.' - Mathematical Reviews
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From reader reviews:

Beth Murray:

Often the book Simplicial Homotopy Theory (Modern Birkhäuser Classics) will bring that you the new
experience of reading a new book. The author style to spell out the idea is very unique. Should you try to
find new book to see, this book very appropriate to you. The book Simplicial Homotopy Theory (Modern
Birkhäuser Classics) is much recommended to you to study. You can also get the e-book from official web
site, so you can more easily to read the book.

Patricia Koop:

A lot of people always spent their very own free time to vacation or maybe go to the outside with them loved
ones or their friend. Are you aware? Many a lot of people spent they free time just watching TV, or perhaps
playing video games all day long. If you wish to try to find a new activity that is look different you can read
a book. It is really fun in your case. If you enjoy the book that you simply read you can spent all day long to
reading a publication. The book Simplicial Homotopy Theory (Modern Birkhäuser Classics) it is very good
to read. There are a lot of people that recommended this book. These people were enjoying reading this
book. In the event you did not have enough space bringing this book you can buy the actual e-book. You can
m0ore simply to read this book from your smart phone. The price is not to fund but this book has high
quality.

Hope Giles:

Are you kind of stressful person, only have 10 as well as 15 minute in your moment to upgrading your mind
expertise or thinking skill actually analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book in comparison
with can satisfy your short period of time to read it because all of this time you only find reserve that need
more time to be read. Simplicial Homotopy Theory (Modern Birkhäuser Classics) can be your answer given
it can be read by an individual who have those short spare time problems.

Debra Becnel:

That e-book can make you to feel relax. This particular book Simplicial Homotopy Theory (Modern
Birkhäuser Classics) was vibrant and of course has pictures on the website. As we know that book Simplicial
Homotopy Theory (Modern Birkhäuser Classics) has many kinds or category. Start from kids until
youngsters. For example Naruto or Investigation company Conan you can read and feel that you are the
character on there. So , not at all of book usually are make you bored, any it makes you feel happy, fun and
loosen up. Try to choose the best book for yourself and try to like reading that.
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