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Most fans of women’s basketball would be startled to learn that girls’ teams were making their mark more
than a century ago—and that none was more prominent than a team from an isolated Indian boarding school
in Montana. Playing like “lambent flames” across the polished floors of dance halls, armories, and
gymnasiums, the girls from Fort Shaw stormed the state to emerge as Montana’s first basketball champions.
Taking their game to the 1904 St. Louis World’s Fair, these young women introduced an international
audience to the fledgling game and returned home with a trophy declaring them champions.

World champions. And yet their triumphs were forgotten—until Linda Peavy and Ursula Smith chanced
upon a team photo and embarked on a ten-year journey of discovery. Their in-depth research and extensive
collaboration with the teammates’ descendents and tribal kin have resulted in a narrative as entertaining as it
is authentic.

Full-Court Quest offers a rare glimpse into American Indian life and into the world of women’s basketball
before “girls’ rules” temporarily shackled the sport. For anyone captivated by Sea Biscuit, A League of Their
Own, and other accounts of unlikely champions, this book rates as nothing but net.
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From reader reviews:

Gene Kistler:

What do you consider book? It is just for students since they are still students or that for all people in the
world, what best subject for that? Just you can be answered for that issue above. Every person has various
personality and hobby for every single other. Don't to be pressured someone or something that they don't
would like do that. You must know how great as well as important the book Full-Court Quest: The Girls
from Fort Shaw Indian School, Basketball Champions of the World. All type of book is it possible to see on
many resources. You can look for the internet options or other social media.

Wilma Shay:

The ability that you get from Full-Court Quest: The Girls from Fort Shaw Indian School, Basketball
Champions of the World is the more deep you digging the information that hide in the words the more you
get enthusiastic about reading it. It doesn't mean that this book is hard to recognise but Full-Court Quest: The
Girls from Fort Shaw Indian School, Basketball Champions of the World giving you enjoyment feeling of
reading. The copy writer conveys their point in a number of way that can be understood simply by anyone
who read this because the author of this e-book is well-known enough. This kind of book also makes your
current vocabulary increase well. Making it easy to understand then can go to you, both in printed or e-book
style are available. We recommend you for having this specific Full-Court Quest: The Girls from Fort Shaw
Indian School, Basketball Champions of the World instantly.

Jackie Armstrong:

Reading a guide tends to be new life style within this era globalization. With reading through you can get a
lot of information which will give you benefit in your life. Using book everyone in this world can certainly
share their idea. Books can also inspire a lot of people. A great deal of author can inspire their very own
reader with their story as well as their experience. Not only the storyline that share in the ebooks. But also
they write about the information about something that you need instance. How to get the good score toefl, or
how to teach your young ones, there are many kinds of book that you can get now. The authors nowadays
always try to improve their talent in writing, they also doing some research before they write to their book.
One of them is this Full-Court Quest: The Girls from Fort Shaw Indian School, Basketball Champions of the
World.

Michael Santiago:

This Full-Court Quest: The Girls from Fort Shaw Indian School, Basketball Champions of the World is great
publication for you because the content that is certainly full of information for you who all always deal with
world and get to make decision every minute. This particular book reveal it facts accurately using great
manage word or we can declare no rambling sentences inside it. So if you are read it hurriedly you can have
whole facts in it. Doesn't mean it only gives you straight forward sentences but tough core information with



attractive delivering sentences. Having Full-Court Quest: The Girls from Fort Shaw Indian School,
Basketball Champions of the World in your hand like having the world in your arm, data in it is not
ridiculous one. We can say that no guide that offer you world inside ten or fifteen tiny right but this
publication already do that. So , this can be good reading book. Heya Mr. and Mrs. active do you still doubt
which?
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