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Behind the Urals, first published in 1942, is a fascinating first-hand account of a young American's journey
to Stalin's Soviet Union where he lived and worked for 6 years helping build a massive steel plant in a
former wilderness east of the Ural Mountains. The isolated settlement grew into the new city of
Magnitogorsk. Author Scott's account remains a classic work on daily life for workers in the Soviet Union of
the 1930s. Of interest too are his own experiences: the dangerous working conditions, extreme cold, food
shortages, and inadequate housing. During his stay, he meets and weds a young Soviet woman, Masha, and
together they have two baby daughters. With the coming of the Stalinist purges, Scott is no longer welcome
in Russia, and he and his wife are forced to separate for 3 years (Scott moving to Moscow) while he attempts
to secure visas for his family to emigrate to America (he is eventually successful in bringing his family to the
U.S.). John Scott, son of Scott Nearing and Nellie Seeds Nearing, was born in 1912, and until his retirement
in 1973 was a correspondent for Time magazine. Scott passed away on December 1, 1976. His wife, Maria
“Masha” Dikareva Scott died on November 5, 2004.
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From reader reviews:

Maureen Perdue:

Do you certainly one of people who can't read satisfying if the sentence chained inside straightway, hold on
guys this kind of aren't like that. This Behind the Urals: American Worker in Russia's City of Steel (Classics
in Russian studies) book is readable by means of you who hate those perfect word style. You will find the
facts here are arrange for enjoyable reading through experience without leaving actually decrease the
knowledge that want to provide to you. The writer associated with Behind the Urals: American Worker in
Russia's City of Steel (Classics in Russian studies) content conveys thinking easily to understand by most
people. The printed and e-book are not different in the content material but it just different in the form of it.
So , do you continue to thinking Behind the Urals: American Worker in Russia's City of Steel (Classics in
Russian studies) is not loveable to be your top listing reading book?

Tiara Arnold:

Reading a book to be new life style in this 12 months; every people loves to go through a book. When you
read a book you can get a wide range of benefit. When you read ebooks, you can improve your knowledge,
since book has a lot of information into it. The information that you will get depend on what forms of book
that you have read. If you wish to get information about your review, you can read education books, but if
you want to entertain yourself read a fiction books, this kind of us novel, comics, and soon. The Behind the
Urals: American Worker in Russia's City of Steel (Classics in Russian studies) provide you with a new
experience in reading a book.

Ken Martin:

That book can make you to feel relax. This kind of book Behind the Urals: American Worker in Russia's
City of Steel (Classics in Russian studies) was bright colored and of course has pictures on the website. As
we know that book Behind the Urals: American Worker in Russia's City of Steel (Classics in Russian
studies) has many kinds or variety. Start from kids until teenagers. For example Naruto or Private eye Conan
you can read and think you are the character on there. So , not at all of book usually are make you bored, any
it offers up you feel happy, fun and rest. Try to choose the best book for you personally and try to like
reading which.

Elbert Lupton:

Reading a publication make you to get more knowledge from it. You can take knowledge and information
coming from a book. Book is created or printed or illustrated from each source that filled update of news. In
this particular modern era like now, many ways to get information are available for an individual. From
media social such as newspaper, magazines, science e-book, encyclopedia, reference book, story and comic.
You can add your knowledge by that book. Isn't it time to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just
searching for the Behind the Urals: American Worker in Russia's City of Steel (Classics in Russian studies)



when you desired it?
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