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A strong theological call for ending the abomination of systemic poverty

Jesus's words "the poor you will always have with you" (Matthew 26:11) are regularly used to suggest that
ending poverty is impossible, that poverty is a result of moral failures, and that the poor themselves have no
role in changing their situation. In this book Liz Theoharis examines both the biblical text and the lived
reality of the poor to show how that passage is taken out of context, distorted, and politicized to justify
theories about the inevitability of inequality.

Theoharis reinterprets "the poor you will always have with you" to show that it is actually one of the
strongest biblical mandates to end poverty. She documents stories of poor people themselves organizing to
improve their lot and illuminates the implications for the church. Poverty is not inevitable, Theoharis argues.
It is a systemic sin, and all Christians have a responsibility to partner with the poor to end poverty once and
for all.
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From reader reviews:

Virginia Villalon:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important action, like
looking for your favorite book and reading a book. Beside you can solve your condition; you can add your
knowledge by the book entitled Always with Us?: What Jesus Really Said about the Poor (Prophetic
Christianity Series (PC)). Try to make the book Always with Us?: What Jesus Really Said about the Poor
(Prophetic Christianity Series (PC)) as your buddy. It means that it can being your friend when you sense
alone and beside those of course make you smarter than in the past. Yeah, it is very fortuned in your case.
The book makes you a lot more confidence because you can know almost everything by the book. So , we
should make new experience and also knowledge with this book.

Virginia Hause:

Have you spare time to get a day? What do you do when you have much more or little spare time? That's
why, you can choose the suitable activity with regard to spend your time. Any person spent their spare time
to take a wander, shopping, or went to the actual Mall. How about open or read a book entitled Always with
Us?: What Jesus Really Said about the Poor (Prophetic Christianity Series (PC))? Maybe it is being best
activity for you. You know beside you can spend your time together with your favorite's book, you can
smarter than before. Do you agree with the opinion or you have some other opinion?

Jason Scott:

This Always with Us?: What Jesus Really Said about the Poor (Prophetic Christianity Series (PC)) book is
not really ordinary book, you have it then the world is in your hands. The benefit you have by reading this
book is information inside this reserve incredible fresh, you will get data which is getting deeper you read a
lot of information you will get. This kind of Always with Us?: What Jesus Really Said about the Poor
(Prophetic Christianity Series (PC)) without we recognize teach the one who reading it become critical in
contemplating and analyzing. Don't possibly be worry Always with Us?: What Jesus Really Said about the
Poor (Prophetic Christianity Series (PC)) can bring whenever you are and not make your handbag space or
bookshelves' turn out to be full because you can have it in your lovely laptop even phone. This Always with
Us?: What Jesus Really Said about the Poor (Prophetic Christianity Series (PC)) having fine arrangement in
word as well as layout, so you will not experience uninterested in reading.

Maria Simmons:

As people who live in the modest era should be revise about what going on or facts even knowledge to make
them keep up with the era which is always change and move forward. Some of you maybe will update
themselves by looking at books. It is a good choice in your case but the problems coming to you is you don't
know what kind you should start with. This Always with Us?: What Jesus Really Said about the Poor
(Prophetic Christianity Series (PC)) is our recommendation so you keep up with the world. Why, since this



book serves what you want and need in this era.
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