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In acquiring and mastering sports skills, a picture is often worth a thousand words. Research shows most
athletes learn skills better through visual demonstration than through verbal instruction. If you're a ""visual
learner,"" Visual Tennis may be the most natural and effective way to improve your game.

The book presents more than 200 photographs-including many of top stars like Pete Sampras, Martina
Hingis, Andre Agassi, and Steffi Graf-so you can imprint images of flawless technique into your mind.
When you get on the court, your mind replays the images, and you develop and refine each stroke until it
matches the proper technique.

As former tennis great John McEnroe-once one of the author's star clients-explains it, ""This book teaches
the way players actually learn."" The outstanding photos combine with simple checkpoints to show exactly
how to learn essential tennis skills, from the forehand through the serve.

Updated and expanded from the highly successful first edition, Visual Tennis provides you with an
alternative to the repetitive verbal cues so common in tennis instruction. Leading teaching pro John Yandell
shares his proven method, which has helped thousands of players realize their potential and raise their game
to new levels.
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From reader reviews:

Lillian Owensby:

Do you have favorite book? In case you have, what is your favorite's book? E-book is very important thing
for us to be aware of everything in the world. Each guide has different aim or maybe goal; it means that book
has different type. Some people really feel enjoy to spend their a chance to read a book. They are really
reading whatever they get because their hobby is definitely reading a book. How about the person who don't
like examining a book? Sometime, man or woman feel need book after they found difficult problem or even
exercise. Well, probably you'll have this Visual Tennis.

Erica Dennis:

What do you concentrate on book? It is just for students since they are still students or that for all people in
the world, the particular best subject for that? Simply you can be answered for that query above. Every
person has various personality and hobby for every single other. Don't to be forced someone or something
that they don't need do that. You must know how great and important the book Visual Tennis. All type of
book can you see on many resources. You can look for the internet options or other social media.

Jennifer Wilson:

Hey guys, do you would like to finds a new book you just read? May be the book with the headline Visual
Tennis suitable to you? The book was written by well-known writer in this era. The actual book untitled
Visual Tennisis the one of several books which everyone read now. This book was inspired a number of
people in the world. When you read this guide you will enter the new shape that you ever know just before.
The author explained their concept in the simple way, thus all of people can easily to comprehend the core of
this book. This book will give you a large amount of information about this world now. So you can see the
represented of the world with this book.

Myrta Bundy:

Reading a reserve make you to get more knowledge from that. You can take knowledge and information
from your book. Book is composed or printed or highlighted from each source that filled update of news.
Within this modern era like now, many ways to get information are available for you actually. From media
social such as newspaper, magazines, science guide, encyclopedia, reference book, novel and comic. You
can add your understanding by that book. Ready to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or just
searching for the Visual Tennis when you needed it?
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