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By using familiar concepts from classical measurement methods and basic statistics, this book introduces the
basics of item response theory (IRT) and explains the application of IRT methods to problems in test
construction, identification of potentially biased test items, test equating and computerized-adaptive testing.
The book also includes a thorough discussion of alternative procedures for estimating IRT parameters and
concludes with an exploration of new directions in IRT research and development.
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From reader reviews:

Jimmy Dietz:

The book Fundamentals of Item Response Theory (Measurement Methods for the Social Science) make you
feel enjoy for your spare time. You need to use to make your capable much more increase. Book can being
your best friend when you getting strain or having big problem along with your subject. If you can make
reading through a book Fundamentals of Item Response Theory (Measurement Methods for the Social
Science) for being your habit, you can get more advantages, like add your current capable, increase your
knowledge about a few or all subjects. You could know everything if you like start and read a reserve
Fundamentals of Item Response Theory (Measurement Methods for the Social Science). Kinds of book are a
lot of. It means that, science e-book or encyclopedia or some others. So , how do you think about this
publication?

Bethel Stockton:

What do you consider book? It is just for students because they're still students or this for all people in the
world, the particular best subject for that? Simply you can be answered for that concern above. Every person
has several personality and hobby for each and every other. Don't to be pressured someone or something that
they don't want do that. You must know how great and also important the book Fundamentals of Item
Response Theory (Measurement Methods for the Social Science). All type of book could you see on many
methods. You can look for the internet methods or other social media.

Michael Albright:

Now a day people who Living in the era everywhere everything reachable by talk with the internet and the
resources within it can be true or not demand people to be aware of each details they get. How many people
to be smart in getting any information nowadays? Of course the answer is reading a book. Studying a book
can help individuals out of this uncertainty Information especially this Fundamentals of Item Response
Theory (Measurement Methods for the Social Science) book because book offers you rich data and
knowledge. Of course the knowledge in this book hundred % guarantees there is no doubt in it you know.

Ralph Scott:

The book untitled Fundamentals of Item Response Theory (Measurement Methods for the Social Science)
contain a lot of information on the item. The writer explains her idea with easy technique. The language is
very clear to see all the people, so do not worry, you can easy to read it. The book was compiled by famous
author. The author will bring you in the new time of literary works. It is easy to read this book because you
can please read on your smart phone, or gadget, so you can read the book inside anywhere and anytime. In a
situation you wish to purchase the e-book, you can start their official web-site and order it. Have a nice
study.
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