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Homo Juridicus focuses on the normative foundations underlying all socio-cultural formations. The book
uses the concept of ''normativity'' in an inclusive sense. It includes law, but it is not limited to it. As such, it
explores the various social and cultural forces that persuade, incite, seduce, influence, direct, restrain, repress
or control behavior. It is a major interdisciplinary study cutting across several disciplines of social science,
such as law, anthropology, sociology, psychology, linguistics and philosophy. Its primary audience is law
students, as well as the scholarly community across law and the social sciences. ''Isaak Dore is one of the
very few scholars who straddles a broad range of legal and nonlegal disciplines. This important book
deconstructs the idea of normativity in culture and illuminates it through various strains of thought in
anthropology, sociology, psychology, linguistics and philosophy. Its grasp of these disciplines is impressive
in terms of nuance, breadth, particularity and lucidity. It is a unique work, brilliantly executed, providing a
rich background against which the promotion of social order through legal and nonlegal norms can be
evaluated. It both provokes and compels one to think outside of the conventional structures and assumptions
of law and social order. I know of no other work that offers the broad intellectual reach that this ambitious
book presents.'' - Laura S. Underkuffler, J. DuPratt White Professor of Law, Cornell Law School
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From reader reviews:

Colin Rousey:

Do you have favorite book? In case you have, what is your favorite's book? Reserve is very important thing
for us to be aware of everything in the world. Each publication has different aim or perhaps goal; it means
that guide has different type. Some people truly feel enjoy to spend their time to read a book. They are
reading whatever they acquire because their hobby is reading a book. What about the person who don't like
reading a book? Sometime, particular person feel need book after they found difficult problem or exercise.
Well, probably you will want this Homo Juridicus: Culture as a Normative Order.

Beverly Turner:

Reading a publication can be one of a lot of task that everyone in the world adores. Do you like reading book
therefore. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoyed. First reading a reserve will give you a lot of new
facts. When you read a e-book you will get new information since book is one of a number of ways to share
the information or their idea. Second, reading a book will make a person more imaginative. When you
reading a book especially fictional book the author will bring someone to imagine the story how the people
do it anything. Third, you can share your knowledge to other individuals. When you read this
Homo Juridicus: Culture as a Normative Order, you can tells your family, friends and soon about yours
reserve. Your knowledge can inspire others, make them reading a publication.

Brooke Fisher:

Reading a guide tends to be new life style on this era globalization. With looking at you can get a lot of
information that can give you benefit in your life. Together with book everyone in this world can share their
idea. Books can also inspire a lot of people. Plenty of author can inspire their very own reader with their
story or their experience. Not only the story that share in the books. But also they write about the knowledge
about something that you need example. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach children, there are
many kinds of book that you can get now. The authors on earth always try to improve their proficiency in
writing, they also doing some exploration before they write to the book. One of them is this Homo Juridicus:
Culture as a Normative Order.

Aaron Edgington:

In this era which is the greater man or who has ability in doing something more are more important than
other. Do you want to become one among it? It is just simple approach to have that. What you are related is
just spending your time not very much but quite enough to enjoy a look at some books. One of many books
in the top checklist in your reading list is Homo Juridicus: Culture as a Normative Order. This book that is
qualified as The Hungry Hillsides can get you closer in getting precious person. By looking upwards and
review this reserve you can get many advantages.
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