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Illuminated: The Figurative Art of Jia Lu is a visual exploration of myth and magic by an internationally
beloved artist.

Long recognized as a leading figure in Chinese and American art, Jia Lu has held more than two hundred
exhibitions of her highly detailed figurative paintings since moving to North America in 1983. Yet no full-
color collection of her work has been available until now.

Illuminated collects 106 oil paintings completed between 2002 and 2007, as Jia Lu continues her exploration
of the human body. Drawing the viewer into a world of radiance and refinement, Jia Lu's ethereal paintings
capture the transience of physical beauty, blending realism of form with the spirit and wisdom of her
subjects. One hundred and fifty-nine color plates, including forty-three full-page color details, are
accompanied by Jia Lu's reflections on her work and insights into her life as an artist.
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From reader reviews:

Diana Saffold:

In this 21st millennium, people become competitive in each and every way. By being competitive currently,
people have do something to make these individuals survives, being in the middle of typically the crowded
place and notice by simply surrounding. One thing that at times many people have underestimated it for a
while is reading. Yep, by reading a book your ability to survive enhance then having chance to endure than
other is high. In your case who want to start reading a new book, we give you that Illuminated: Figurative
Art by Jia Lu book as basic and daily reading book. Why, because this book is greater than just a book.

Sophie Clark:

Spent a free time to be fun activity to try and do! A lot of people spent their sparetime with their family, or
their particular friends. Usually they accomplishing activity like watching television, going to beach, or
picnic inside the park. They actually doing same thing every week. Do you feel it? Will you something
different to fill your personal free time/ holiday? Could possibly be reading a book could be option to fill
your totally free time/ holiday. The first thing you will ask may be what kinds of reserve that you should
read. If you want to try look for book, may be the e-book untitled Illuminated: Figurative Art by Jia Lu can
be excellent book to read. May be it could be best activity to you.

Joshua Poulson:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray an individual, why because this Illuminated: Figurative Art by Jia Lu
publication written by well-known writer who really knows well how to make book that may be understand
by anyone who have read the book. Written within good manner for you, still dripping wet every ideas and
creating skill only for eliminate your own personal hunger then you still uncertainty Illuminated: Figurative
Art by Jia Lu as good book but not only by the cover but also with the content. This is one reserve that can
break don't evaluate book by its protect, so do you still needing another sixth sense to pick this!? Oh come on
your reading sixth sense already told you so why you have to listening to an additional sixth sense.

Richard Lawrence:

Is it you who having spare time then spend it whole day by simply watching television programs or just
resting on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Illuminated: Figurative Art by Jia Lu can be
the solution, oh how comes? The new book you know. You are and so out of date, spending your extra time
by reading in this fresh era is common not a geek activity. So what these textbooks have than the others?
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