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Mark Twain once famously said "there was but one solitary thing about the past worth remembering, and
that was the fact that it is past and can't be restored."  Well, over recent years, The British Library, working
with Microsoft has embarked on an ambitious programme to digitise its collection of 19th century books.

There are now 65,000  titles available  (that's an incredible 25 million pages) of material ranging from works
by famous names such as  Dickens, Trollope and Hardy as well as many forgotten literary gems , all of
which can now be printed on demand and purchased right here on Amazon.

Further information on The British Library and its digitisation programme can be found on The British
Library website.
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From reader reviews:

Kelly Neidig:

The book The Land of Thor ... Illustrated by the Author. will bring one to the new experience of reading any
book. The author style to clarify the idea is very unique. Should you try to find new book you just read, this
book very ideal to you. The book The Land of Thor ... Illustrated by the Author. is much recommended to
you you just read. You can also get the e-book in the official web site, so you can easier to read the book.

Connie Cornish:

The actual book The Land of Thor ... Illustrated by the Author. has a lot details on it. So when you read this
book you can get a lot of profit. The book was compiled by the very famous author. The writer makes some
research before write this book. That book very easy to read you will get the point easily after scanning this
book.

Kurt Hooper:

This The Land of Thor ... Illustrated by the Author. is great book for you because the content that is full of
information for you who all always deal with world and still have to make decision every minute. That book
reveal it data accurately using great coordinate word or we can state no rambling sentences within it. So if
you are read it hurriedly you can have whole details in it. Doesn't mean it only offers you straight forward
sentences but hard core information with splendid delivering sentences. Having The Land of Thor ...
Illustrated by the Author. in your hand like having the world in your arm, info in it is not ridiculous one. We
can say that no e-book that offer you world inside ten or fifteen second right but this e-book already do that.
So , this can be good reading book. Hey there Mr. and Mrs. active do you still doubt this?

James Ritchey:

In this period of time globalization it is important to someone to get information. The information will make
someone to understand the condition of the world. The healthiness of the world makes the information easier
to share. You can find a lot of referrals to get information example: internet, paper, book, and soon. You will
see that now, a lot of publisher this print many kinds of book. Often the book that recommended to you is
The Land of Thor ... Illustrated by the Author. this guide consist a lot of the information on the condition of
this world now. This particular book was represented how do the world has grown up. The words styles that
writer use to explain it is easy to understand. Typically the writer made some study when he makes this
book. Here is why this book appropriate all of you.
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