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This book is about questions -- profound questions which have no objective answers, yet serve as the
foundation of religious faith. Does God exist? If He does, what does He expect of us? How can we recognize
sacred texts? In what sense is the Bible the “Word of God?” What is the relationship between the historical
and the biblical Jesus? Do humans really have free will? In the modern age, can science and religion be
compatible? How can we understand good and evil? Should we believe in prophesy? Miracles? Prayer? A
final judgment? Heaven and hell? Scientist James Rhoades approaches these questions by examining how
well the possible subjective answers theologians have proposed to these questions mesh with the world as we
know it. In "Among the Ruins," the author traces his own evolution from main stream Christian to doubting
skeptic. Labeling himself a “backsliding agnostic,” Rhoades explores the balance between intellectual
agnosticism and an emotional desire to believe. He provides no absolute answers, but rather food for thought
and a justification for tolerance rather than dogmatism in approaching the complex world of religious
difference. Ten years in the making, the book represents the author’s personal search for answers to
ultimately unanswerable questions. It is not written to dissuade believers or to challenge atheists, but rather
to inspire likeminded seekers to continue the search for an understanding that will be personally satisfying.
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From reader reviews:

Melvin Wilhelm:

Book is actually written, printed, or highlighted for everything. You can know everything you want by a e-
book. Book has a different type. To be sure that book is important factor to bring us around the world.
Adjacent to that you can your reading skill was fluently. A reserve Among The Ruins: A Backsliding
Agnostic's Quest For God will make you to become smarter. You can feel far more confidence if you can
know about almost everything. But some of you think in which open or reading a new book make you bored.
It is not necessarily make you fun. Why they could be thought like that? Have you seeking best book or
suitable book with you?

Leroy Raymond:

What do you with regards to book? It is not important along? Or just adding material when you need
something to explain what the one you have problem? How about your spare time? Or are you busy person?
If you don't have spare time to try and do others business, it is give you a sense of feeling bored faster. And
you have free time? What did you do? All people has many questions above. The doctor has to answer that
question simply because just their can do this. It said that about guide. Book is familiar on every person. Yes,
it is proper. Because start from on kindergarten until university need that Among The Ruins: A Backsliding
Agnostic's Quest For God to read.

Andrew Purdie:

Information is provisions for people to get better life, information these days can get by anyone from
everywhere. The information can be a understanding or any news even a huge concern. What people must be
consider while those information which is inside former life are challenging to be find than now is taking
seriously which one would work to believe or which one typically the resource are convinced. If you get the
unstable resource then you get it as your main information we will see huge disadvantage for you. All of
those possibilities will not happen inside you if you take Among The Ruins: A Backsliding Agnostic's Quest
For God as your daily resource information.

Sarah Porter:

Many people spending their moment by playing outside having friends, fun activity with family or just
watching TV the whole day. You can have new activity to shell out your whole day by studying a book. Ugh,
do you consider reading a book can definitely hard because you have to take the book everywhere? It all
right you can have the e-book, getting everywhere you want in your Smartphone. Like Among The Ruins: A
Backsliding Agnostic's Quest For God which is finding the e-book version. So , why not try out this book?
Let's notice.
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