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The year is 1796, and three and a half years have passed since Captain Lightfoot and his crew helped restore
justice and peace to Tonga. It is time for them to return to their colony in New Holland, and then on to
Mother England. But fate plays strange tricks in this vast ocean, even on the true of heart, and Lightfoot and
his Polynesian crew find themselves facing an old enemy. Meanwhile, far off in the Torres Strait, a Dutch
East India merchant ship is wrecked on an uncharted reef. When the captain and officers are murdered by the
mutinous crew, a fortune in gold and jewels locked away in the ship’s belly goes up for grabs. As fate brings
these two crews together, Lightfoot, Sevesi, Hurley and Hiki will encounter the ruthless Company men,
warring Aborigines, brutal Portuguese authorities and man-eating crocodiles. With the odds stacked against
them, will the crew of the Royal make it out alive?
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From reader reviews:

Rebecca West:

In this 21st centuries, people become competitive in every single way. By being competitive at this point,
people have do something to make these survives, being in the middle of the crowded place and notice by
simply surrounding. One thing that sometimes many people have underestimated the item for a while is
reading. Yeah, by reading a guide your ability to survive improve then having chance to remain than other is
high. For you personally who want to start reading a new book, we give you this Islands of Gold book as
basic and daily reading publication. Why, because this book is more than just a book.

Donald Freeman:

As people who live in typically the modest era should be up-date about what going on or data even
knowledge to make them keep up with the era that is always change and make progress. Some of you maybe
can update themselves by studying books. It is a good choice for you but the problems coming to an
individual is you don't know what type you should start with. This Islands of Gold is our recommendation to
help you keep up with the world. Why, as this book serves what you want and need in this era.

Joseph Boyd:

A lot of guide has printed but it differs. You can get it by online on social media. You can choose the best
book for you, science, comic, novel, or whatever by means of searching from it. It is named of book Islands
of Gold. You can add your knowledge by it. Without making the printed book, it may add your knowledge
and make you happier to read. It is most critical that, you must aware about e-book. It can bring you from
one spot to other place.

Rosa Milliken:

Many people said that they feel weary when they reading a book. They are directly felt the item when they
get a half areas of the book. You can choose the book Islands of Gold to make your own reading is
interesting. Your skill of reading expertise is developing when you including reading. Try to choose
straightforward book to make you enjoy to see it and mingle the impression about book and studying
especially. It is to be very first opinion for you to like to wide open a book and go through it. Beside that the
reserve Islands of Gold can to be your new friend when you're sense alone and confuse with the information
must you're doing of their time.
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