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This new, all color magazine features a bottom-centric cavalcade of charming girls and ladies going over the
laps of dominant women. Poignant paddlings, stringent strappings and over the knee spankings galore
comprise this exquisite photographic collection from the vaults of Shadow Lane. Includes ten separate girl-
spanks-girl photo spreads. All photos hand picked and captioned by Eve Howard, author of the Shadow Lane
novels and director of Shadow Lane's video arm. Also features vintage Tarsis spanking art, which has long
set the standard of beauty and taste in erotic illustrations.

About the Editor:
Eve Howard has edited some of the most iconic spanking magazines of the last thirty years, including Stand
Corrected and The Art of Spanking. Eve is also the author of the Shadow Lane novel series, known for its
sophisticated and irreverent approach to alt lifestyle romance. In the middle 1980's, when Eve began working
on spanking magazines for adult publishers, there was little to captivate the intelligent and sensitive female
reader and viewer. Shadow Lane soon began to film and print spanking erotica that women could enjoy.
Eve's first paperback publisher was Blue Moon, whose books were sold worldwide, while a series of tiny
classified ads in the back of Cosmo for Eve's books and videos, brought thousands of female spanking
enthusiasts out of the closet for the first time. Eve is currently working on the next volume of Shadow Lane.
Her most recent interview can be found in Different Loving Too, edited by Dr. Gloria G. Brame. Eve
Howard's blog appears regularly on the Shadow Lane website.
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From reader reviews:

Herb Baker:

Nowadays reading books are more than want or need but also turn into a life style. This reading habit give
you lot of advantages. The advantages you got of course the knowledge the particular information inside the
book that improve your knowledge and information. The knowledge you get based on what kind of book you
read, if you want send more knowledge just go with schooling books but if you want really feel happy read
one together with theme for entertaining including comic or novel. Typically the Shadow Lane Presents
Female Spanks Female Photoplay: Pictorial Erotica for the Over-The-Knee Spanking Enthusiast is kind of
publication which is giving the reader unpredictable experience.

Brandon Erickson:

Information is provisions for anyone to get better life, information nowadays can get by anyone with
everywhere. The information can be a know-how or any news even a huge concern. What people must be
consider while those information which is inside former life are difficult to be find than now is taking
seriously which one is acceptable to believe or which one the particular resource are convinced. If you
receive the unstable resource then you get it as your main information you will have huge disadvantage for
you. All those possibilities will not happen throughout you if you take Shadow Lane Presents Female Spanks
Female Photoplay: Pictorial Erotica for the Over-The-Knee Spanking Enthusiast as your daily resource
information.

William Pare:

A lot of people always spent all their free time to vacation as well as go to the outside with them friends and
family or their friend. Did you know? Many a lot of people spent many people free time just watching TV, as
well as playing video games all day long. If you would like try to find a new activity that's look different you
can read a book. It is really fun for yourself. If you enjoy the book you read you can spent all day every day
to reading a publication. The book Shadow Lane Presents Female Spanks Female Photoplay: Pictorial
Erotica for the Over-The-Knee Spanking Enthusiast it is rather good to read. There are a lot of folks that
recommended this book. These people were enjoying reading this book. In case you did not have enough
space to bring this book you can buy the e-book. You can m0ore effortlessly to read this book from the smart
phone. The price is not too costly but this book features high quality.

Arthur Prince:

Reading a publication make you to get more knowledge from that. You can take knowledge and information
from the book. Book is created or printed or created from each source this filled update of news. On this
modern era like right now, many ways to get information are available for you actually. From media social
including newspaper, magazines, science e-book, encyclopedia, reference book, fresh and comic. You can
add your understanding by that book. Ready to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just in search of



the Shadow Lane Presents Female Spanks Female Photoplay: Pictorial Erotica for the Over-The-Knee
Spanking Enthusiast when you needed it?
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