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THIS IS A MUST READ! It is the first and the original book of quantitative questions from finance job
interviews. Painstakingly revised over 21 years and 17 editions, Heard on The Street has been shaped by
feedback from many hundreds of readers. With over 50,000 copies in print, its readership is unmatched by
any competing book. The revised 17th edition contains 190 quantitative questions collected from actual job
interviews in investment banking, investment management, and options trading. The interviewers use the
same questions year-after-year, and here they are with detailed solutions! This edition also includes over 145
non-quantitative actual interview questions, giving a total of more than 335 actual finance job interview
questions. There is also a revised section on interview technique based on Dr. Crack's experiences
interviewing candidates and also based on feedback from interviewers worldwide. The quant questions cover
pure quant/logic, financial economics, derivatives, and statistics. They come from all types of interviews
(corporate finance, sales and trading, quant research, etc.), and from all levels of interviews (undergraduate,
MS, MBA, PhD). The first seven editions of Heard on the Street contained an appendix on option pricing.
That appendix was carved out as a standalone book many years ago and it is now available in its revised
third edition: "Basic Black-Scholes" ISBN=9780994103857. Dr. Crack has a PhD from MIT. He has won
many teaching awards, and has publications in the top academic, practitioner, and teaching journals in
finance. He has degrees/diplomas in Mathematics/Statistics, Finance, Financial Economics and
Accounting/Finance. Dr. Crack taught at the university level for over 20 years including four years as a front
line teaching assistant for MBA students at MIT. He has worked as an independent consultant to the New
York Stock Exchange, and his most recent practitioner job was as the head of a quantitative active equity
research team at what was the world's largest institutional money manager.
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From reader reviews:

Troy Ethridge:

Hey guys, do you would like to finds a new book you just read? May be the book with the title Heard on the
Street: Quantitative Questions from Wall Street Job Interviews suitable to you? The actual book was written
by famous writer in this era. The actual book untitled Heard on the Street: Quantitative Questions from Wall
Street Job Interviewsis the main of several books that will everyone read now. This particular book was
inspired a number of people in the world. When you read this guide you will enter the new age that you ever
know prior to. The author explained their idea in the simple way, so all of people can easily to understand the
core of this publication. This book will give you a wide range of information about this world now. In order
to see the represented of the world on this book.

Ben Hernandez:

Do you have something that you want such as book? The publication lovers usually prefer to select book like
comic, brief story and the biggest the first is novel. Now, why not trying Heard on the Street: Quantitative
Questions from Wall Street Job Interviews that give your fun preference will be satisfied through reading
this book. Reading habit all over the world can be said as the method for people to know world much better
then how they react in the direction of the world. It can't be explained constantly that reading practice only
for the geeky person but for all of you who wants to possibly be success person. So , for every you who want
to start looking at as your good habit, you are able to pick Heard on the Street: Quantitative Questions from
Wall Street Job Interviews become your starter.

Kevin Hamby:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray an individual, why because this Heard on the Street: Quantitative
Questions from Wall Street Job Interviews e-book written by well-known writer who really knows well how
to make book that can be understand by anyone who read the book. Written inside good manner for you,
leaking every ideas and writing skill only for eliminate your current hunger then you still doubt Heard on the
Street: Quantitative Questions from Wall Street Job Interviews as good book not simply by the cover but also
by the content. This is one publication that can break don't assess book by its deal with, so do you still
needing an additional sixth sense to pick this kind of!? Oh come on your examining sixth sense already
alerted you so why you have to listening to a different sixth sense.

Marvin Ober:

Do you like reading a book? Confuse to looking for your favorite book? Or your book seemed to be rare?
Why so many concern for the book? But just about any people feel that they enjoy intended for reading.
Some people likes examining, not only science book but novel and Heard on the Street: Quantitative
Questions from Wall Street Job Interviews or even others sources were given information for you. After you
know how the good a book, you feel desire to read more and more. Science book was created for teacher or



students especially. Those publications are helping them to increase their knowledge. In other case, beside
science guide, any other book likes Heard on the Street: Quantitative Questions from Wall Street Job
Interviews to make your spare time far more colorful. Many types of book like this one.
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