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On October 29, 2012, Hurricane Sandy made landfall in the Mid-Atlantic region. The devastation she
brought to the New York and New Jersey was widespread and unimaginable. Though warnings had been
issued for days and many evacuated their homes and offices, thousands stood in the path of one of the
strongest storms in the history of America. Winds on Long Island reached 90 mph. Large sections of Lower
Manhattan flooded. Fire in Queens destroyed more than 100 buildings. In New Jersey, 2.6 million homes
were without people and nearly 40 people were killed. A 50-foot piece of the Atlantic City Boardwalk
washed away and half the city of Hoboken was under water. Hundreds of thousands were left without power
and water, with dwindling food supplies. Amidst this devastation, Sandy inspired courage and hope in many
New Yorkers, giving them the will to triumph against incalculable odds. Seeking shelter and the basic
necessities of life, thousands continued to fight to simply survive the harshest of conditions and help others
do the same. These gripping moments of ruin and recovery are captured in Sandy: A Story of Complete
Devastation, Courage, and Recovery, which features award-winning stories and nearly 100 vivid, full-color
images from the New York Post. A portion of the proceeds from the sale of each book will be donated to the
Mayor’s Fund for New York City and Hurricane Sandy New Jersey Relief Fund.
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From reader reviews:

Debra Richardson:

Reading a book can be one of a lot of exercise that everyone in the world adores. Do you like reading book
therefore. There are a lot of reasons why people fantastic. First reading a e-book will give you a lot of new
facts. When you read a reserve you will get new information due to the fact book is one of several ways to
share the information as well as their idea. Second, looking at a book will make you actually more
imaginative. When you reading a book especially hype book the author will bring that you imagine the story
how the personas do it anything. Third, you can share your knowledge to others. When you read this Sandy:
A Story of Complete Devastation, Courage, and Recovery, you may tells your family, friends along with
soon about yours e-book. Your knowledge can inspire average, make them reading a reserve.

Daniel Padilla:

A lot of people always spent their particular free time to vacation or perhaps go to the outside with them
household or their friend. Do you know? Many a lot of people spent that they free time just watching TV, or
maybe playing video games all day long. In order to try to find a new activity here is look different you can
read a book. It is really fun in your case. If you enjoy the book that you just read you can spent all day every
day to reading a reserve. The book Sandy: A Story of Complete Devastation, Courage, and Recovery it is
extremely good to read. There are a lot of folks that recommended this book. We were holding enjoying
reading this book. When you did not have enough space to bring this book you can buy the e-book. You can
m0ore very easily to read this book from a smart phone. The price is not too costly but this book has high
quality.

Michael Ramsey:

Are you kind of hectic person, only have 10 as well as 15 minute in your day to upgrading your mind ability
or thinking skill even analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book when compared with can
satisfy your small amount of time to read it because all of this time you only find guide that need more time
to be read. Sandy: A Story of Complete Devastation, Courage, and Recovery can be your answer since it can
be read by a person who have those short time problems.

Travis Hargrove:

Many people said that they feel fed up when they reading a publication. They are directly felt the idea when
they get a half elements of the book. You can choose the book Sandy: A Story of Complete Devastation,
Courage, and Recovery to make your current reading is interesting. Your own skill of reading skill is
developing when you like reading. Try to choose easy book to make you enjoy you just read it and mingle
the sensation about book and looking at especially. It is to be initially opinion for you to like to start a book
and learn it. Beside that the e-book Sandy: A Story of Complete Devastation, Courage, and Recovery can to
be a newly purchased friend when you're feel alone and confuse in what must you're doing of the time.
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