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Modern readers are becoming increasingly drawn to the works of Statius, an erudite poet of the first century
AD who gained particular popularity in Late Antiquity and the Middle Ages. Thebaid is a twelve-book Latin
epic, which he composed around AD 80-92, and tells the mythological story of the expedition of the seven
warriors against Thebes as they try to oust Eteocles from the throne in favour of his brother Polynices. Book
4 includes a catalogue of the attacking warriors, a depiction of a necromantic summoning of ghosts, and a
description of the invading army's relief from thirst.

In this volume Parkes offers the first full-length scholarly commentary on the whole of Thebaid 4, with text
and apparatus criticus, an English translation, and a comprehensive introduction which discusses the various
features of Thebaid 4, its relationship with the poem as a whole, and the place ofThebaid in literary tradition
- both in terms of its engagement with prior works and its impact on later literature. In addition to an analysis
of Statius' linguistic usage and the book's textual problems, the commentary examines aspects of literary
interpretation such as the development of the epic's themes, and the use of allusion.
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From reader reviews:

Marilyn Vance:

In this 21st hundred years, people become competitive in every single way. By being competitive currently,
people have do something to make them survives, being in the middle of the particular crowded place and
notice by surrounding. One thing that sometimes many people have underestimated it for a while is reading.
That's why, by reading a e-book your ability to survive enhance then having chance to endure than other is
high. For you personally who want to start reading a book, we give you this particular Statius, Thebiad 4:
Edited with an Introduction, Translation, and Commentary (Oxford Classical Monographs) book as
beginning and daily reading e-book. Why, because this book is greater than just a book.

Michael Kautz:

The feeling that you get from Statius, Thebiad 4: Edited with an Introduction, Translation, and Commentary
(Oxford Classical Monographs) is the more deep you digging the information that hide in the words the more
you get thinking about reading it. It doesn't mean that this book is hard to be aware of but Statius, Thebiad 4:
Edited with an Introduction, Translation, and Commentary (Oxford Classical Monographs) giving you
enjoyment feeling of reading. The article writer conveys their point in a number of way that can be
understood simply by anyone who read this because the author of this publication is well-known enough.
This kind of book also makes your vocabulary increase well. That makes it easy to understand then can go
with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We recommend you for having this specific Statius,
Thebiad 4: Edited with an Introduction, Translation, and Commentary (Oxford Classical Monographs)
instantly.

Candy Smith:

Reading can called head hangout, why? Because if you find yourself reading a book mainly book entitled
Statius, Thebiad 4: Edited with an Introduction, Translation, and Commentary (Oxford Classical
Monographs) your brain will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in each aspect that maybe
unknown for but surely will end up your mind friends. Imaging every single word written in a book then
become one form conclusion and explanation in which maybe you never get just before. The Statius,
Thebiad 4: Edited with an Introduction, Translation, and Commentary (Oxford Classical Monographs)
giving you another experience more than blown away your head but also giving you useful data for your
better life on this era. So now let us show you the relaxing pattern this is your body and mind is going to be
pleased when you are finished looking at it, like winning an activity. Do you want to try this extraordinary
investing spare time activity?

Kathy Ahmed:

This Statius, Thebiad 4: Edited with an Introduction, Translation, and Commentary (Oxford Classical
Monographs) is great book for you because the content that is certainly full of information for you who have



always deal with world and possess to make decision every minute. This particular book reveal it
information accurately using great arrange word or we can declare no rambling sentences inside. So if you
are read the item hurriedly you can have whole info in it. Doesn't mean it only provides you with straight
forward sentences but difficult core information with lovely delivering sentences. Having Statius, Thebiad 4:
Edited with an Introduction, Translation, and Commentary (Oxford Classical Monographs) in your hand like
obtaining the world in your arm, data in it is not ridiculous just one. We can say that no book that offer you
world in ten or fifteen tiny right but this reserve already do that. So , this is good reading book. Heya Mr. and
Mrs. stressful do you still doubt that will?
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