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The Slayers' lives are short, and not very sweet. The Watchers' Journals are full of their tales -- their battles,
their triumphs, and ultimately, their successors.
Buffy the Vampire Slayer is but the latest in a long line of women warriors stretching back to the dawn of
humankind. As long as there have been vampires, there has been a Slayer. Usually called in her teens, the
Chosen One leads a brief life full of conflict and doom.
From the Anasazi villages of A.D. 1250 to Shanghai, China, in 1866, from Hollywood in the '40s to Buffy's
predecessor in Tokyo of the '90s, Slayers have always risen above their most recent defeat.
Four best-selling Buffy novelists come together in a collection of novellas chronicling tales of Slayers past.
Christopher Golden, Nancy Holder, Mel Odom, and Yvonne Navarro each present a new entry in the historic
line of Slayers.
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From reader reviews:

Danny Whittemore:

Book is to be different per grade. Book for children until adult are different content. As we know that book is
very important usually. The book Tales of the Slayer, Volume 3 (Buffy the Vampire Slayer) had been
making you to know about other information and of course you can take more information. It is rather
advantages for you. The reserve Tales of the Slayer, Volume 3 (Buffy the Vampire Slayer) is not only giving
you much more new information but also being your friend when you sense bored. You can spend your
spend time to read your guide. Try to make relationship with all the book Tales of the Slayer, Volume 3
(Buffy the Vampire Slayer). You never sense lose out for everything should you read some books.

John White:

Information is provisions for anyone to get better life, information presently can get by anyone from
everywhere. The information can be a understanding or any news even a concern. What people must be
consider any time those information which is inside the former life are challenging to be find than now is
taking seriously which one works to believe or which one the resource are convinced. If you receive the
unstable resource then you have it as your main information you will have huge disadvantage for you. All of
those possibilities will not happen inside you if you take Tales of the Slayer, Volume 3 (Buffy the Vampire
Slayer) as your daily resource information.

Karolyn Kaufman:

Reading a book for being new life style in this season; every people loves to examine a book. When you
study a book you can get a large amount of benefit. When you read publications, you can improve your
knowledge, since book has a lot of information onto it. The information that you will get depend on what
kinds of book that you have read. In order to get information about your examine, you can read education
books, but if you act like you want to entertain yourself you are able to a fiction books, these kinds of us
novel, comics, in addition to soon. The Tales of the Slayer, Volume 3 (Buffy the Vampire Slayer) will give
you a new experience in looking at a book.

Concepcion Shaw:

Many people spending their time by playing outside along with friends, fun activity having family or just
watching TV the whole day. You can have new activity to invest your whole day by reading through a book.
Ugh, ya think reading a book can really hard because you have to take the book everywhere? It fine you can
have the e-book, delivering everywhere you want in your Smart phone. Like Tales of the Slayer, Volume 3
(Buffy the Vampire Slayer) which is having the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's view.
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