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As a religion concerned with universal liberation, Zen grew out of a Buddhist worldview very different from
the currently prevalent scientific materialism. Indeed, says Taigen Dan Leighton, Zen cannot be fully
understood outside of a worldview that sees reality itself as a vital, dynamic agent of awareness and healing.
In this book, Leighton explicates that worldview through the writings of the Zen master Eihei D?gen (1200-
1253), considered the founder of the Japanese S?t? Zen tradition, which currently enjoys increasing
popularity in the West.

The Lotus Sutra, arguably the most important Buddhist scripture in East Asia, contains a famous story about
bodhisattvas (enlightening beings) who emerge from under the earth to preserve and expound the Lotus
teaching in the distant future. The story reveals that the Buddha only appears to pass away, but actually has
been practicing, and will continue to do so, over an inconceivably long life span.

Leighton traces commentaries on the Lotus Sutra from a range of key East Asian Buddhist thinkers,
including Daosheng, Zhiyi, Zhanran, Saigyo, My?e, Nichiren, Hakuin, and Ry?kan. But his main focus is
Eihei D?gen, the 13th century Japanese S?t? Zen founder who imported Zen from China, and whose profuse,
provocative, and poetic writings are important to the modern expansion of Buddhism to the West.

D?gen's use of this sutra expresses the critical role of Mahayana vision and imagination as the context of Zen
teaching, and his interpretations of this story furthermore reveal his dynamic worldview of the earth, space,
and time themselves as vital agents of spiritual awakening.

Leighton argues that D?gen uses the images and metaphors in this story to express his own religious
worldview, in which earth, space, and time are lively agents in the bodhisattva project. Broader awareness of
D?gen's worldview and its implications, says Leighton, can illuminate the possibilities for contemporary
approaches to primary Mahayana concepts and practices.
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From reader reviews:

Diego Mears:

Book is to be different for every single grade. Book for children until eventually adult are different content.
To be sure that book is very important for us. The book Visions of Awakening Space and Time: D?gen and
the Lotus Sutra was making you to know about other understanding and of course you can take more
information. It is quite advantages for you. The e-book Visions of Awakening Space and Time: D?gen and
the Lotus Sutra is not only giving you considerably more new information but also being your friend when
you really feel bored. You can spend your current spend time to read your guide. Try to make relationship
together with the book Visions of Awakening Space and Time: D?gen and the Lotus Sutra. You never feel
lose out for everything in the event you read some books.

Thomas Welty:

Nowadays reading books be a little more than want or need but also be a life style. This reading routine give
you lot of advantages. The advantages you got of course the knowledge the particular information inside the
book which improve your knowledge and information. The info you get based on what kind of book you
read, if you want send more knowledge just go with knowledge books but if you want sense happy read one
having theme for entertaining including comic or novel. Often the Visions of Awakening Space and Time:
D?gen and the Lotus Sutra is kind of e-book which is giving the reader unforeseen experience.

Robert Delaney:

Hey guys, do you really wants to finds a new book to see? May be the book with the name Visions of
Awakening Space and Time: D?gen and the Lotus Sutra suitable to you? Often the book was written by
famous writer in this era. The book untitled Visions of Awakening Space and Time: D?gen and the Lotus
Sutrais the main one of several books this everyone read now. This particular book was inspired many
people in the world. When you read this publication you will enter the new age that you ever know before.
The author explained their thought in the simple way, consequently all of people can easily to be aware of
the core of this e-book. This book will give you a lot of information about this world now. To help you see
the represented of the world on this book.

Terrance Pitt:

People live in this new morning of lifestyle always aim to and must have the spare time or they will get lots
of stress from both way of life and work. So , if we ask do people have free time, we will say absolutely yes.
People is human not a robot. Then we question again, what kind of activity do you have when the spare time
coming to an individual of course your answer may unlimited right. Then do you try this one, reading
publications. It can be your alternative in spending your spare time, often the book you have read is usually
Visions of Awakening Space and Time: D?gen and the Lotus Sutra.
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