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We Can, But Should We? One Physician’s Reflections on End of Life Ethical Dilemmas is a hybrid: part
memoir, part reflection, and part text. It explores specific ethical values and dilemmas that frequently occur
in hospital settings. Dr. Gospe, with over thirty years experience in bioethics, draws the reader into the maze
of making end of life decisions. His extensive consultations and ethical patient care conferences form the
basis of this book. He gives the reader an insight to this world of endings and beginnings. Though the cases
are real, the names and events have been changed to protect the privacy of the patients and hospital staff.
Each of the sixteen narratives outlines stepping-stones for patients, families, and the professional staff as
they seek solutions with or for a loved one. Each story reveals both the frailty and the strength of being
human. Each story is both heartbreaking and soul nurturing. Dr. Gospe likens the nature of an ethical
dilemma to a broken ancient pottery urn. When we first look upon the pieces that litter the ground, our eyes
see a multitude of small irregular unrelated shapes. It may take hours or days of struggle to find where each
one fits. Solving a medical dilemma is filled with pieces too: tests, multiple diagnoses, and varied treatment
options. Only when all the information is laid out along with the pros and cons for each specific treatment, is
it possible for all involved to view a bigger picture. Like the shards that morph into a beautiful vessel, the
important pieces of the patient’s story and her current status reveal a solution. This process can give the
hospital staff and patient’s family heartfelt peace in knowing their patient is receiving the most appropriate
care for her condition, according to her desires. Dr. Gospe offers perspective and advice for healthcare
providers and families as they navigate end of life medical ethical issues. He does this by evaluating medical
dilemmas through the lens of ever-changing goals of therapy, seemingly contrasting values, and active
listening. He suggests that all concerned become proactive in seeking resolution of these issues before they
grow into unmanageable situations. He also offers ideas to reverse the dysfunction that may arise between
the medical team and the patient's family. The key for professionals, patients, and families alike is to come
together with a non-judgmental attitude when communicating concerns or revising treatment plans.
Participation in engagement of decision-making enriches everyone. We Can, but Should We? may be
utilized as a teaching guide for members of hospital ethics committees, practicing physicians, nurses, social
workers, and chaplains as well as students in the medical field. It can also be helpful for family members,
clergy, and other support people caring for a loved one.
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From reader reviews:

Tara Carlson:

This We Can, But Should We?: One Physician's Reflections on End of Life Dilemmas usually are reliable
for you who want to become a successful person, why. The explanation of this We Can, But Should We?:
One Physician's Reflections on End of Life Dilemmas can be on the list of great books you must have will be
giving you more than just simple examining food but feed an individual with information that perhaps will
shock your prior knowledge. This book is usually handy, you can bring it just about everywhere and
whenever your conditions in e-book and printed people. Beside that this We Can, But Should We?: One
Physician's Reflections on End of Life Dilemmas giving you an enormous of experience for example rich
vocabulary, giving you test of critical thinking that we understand it useful in your day exercise. So , let's
have it and luxuriate in reading.

Kathryn Granger:

A lot of people always spent their very own free time to vacation or even go to the outside with them family
or their friend. Did you know? Many a lot of people spent that they free time just watching TV, or even
playing video games all day long. If you want to try to find a new activity this is look different you can read
any book. It is really fun for you. If you enjoy the book that you simply read you can spent 24 hours a day to
reading a reserve. The book We Can, But Should We?: One Physician's Reflections on End of Life
Dilemmas it is quite good to read. There are a lot of folks that recommended this book. They were enjoying
reading this book. If you did not have enough space to create this book you can buy often the e-book. You
can m0ore effortlessly to read this book out of your smart phone. The price is not to fund but this book offers
high quality.

Hoyt Adkins:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray a person, why because this We Can, But Should We?: One Physician's
Reflections on End of Life Dilemmas book written by well-known writer who knows well how to make book
which might be understand by anyone who read the book. Written throughout good manner for you, dripping
every ideas and publishing skill only for eliminate your hunger then you still question We Can, But Should
We?: One Physician's Reflections on End of Life Dilemmas as good book not only by the cover but also
from the content. This is one guide that can break don't determine book by its protect, so do you still needing
a different sixth sense to pick this kind of!? Oh come on your reading sixth sense already told you so why
you have to listening to a different sixth sense.

Danielle Burdette:

This We Can, But Should We?: One Physician's Reflections on End of Life Dilemmas is brand-new way for
you who has fascination to look for some information as it relief your hunger info. Getting deeper you in it
getting knowledge more you know otherwise you who still having small amount of digest in reading this We



Can, But Should We?: One Physician's Reflections on End of Life Dilemmas can be the light food to suit
your needs because the information inside this specific book is easy to get simply by anyone. These books
acquire itself in the form that is reachable by anyone, that's why I mean in the e-book contact form. People
who think that in reserve form make them feel sleepy even dizzy this publication is the answer. So there is
absolutely no in reading a e-book especially this one. You can find what you are looking for. It should be
here for a person. So , don't miss it! Just read this e-book variety for your better life in addition to
knowledge.
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